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"[An] astute meditation on the intersection between belief systems and the politics of aggression."
~Publishers Weekly    
             
When Leora Ebersole sees the small plane crash in her Old Order Mennonite community, she has no idea it's
a foreshadowing of things to come. Soon after the young pilot, Moses Hughes, regains consciousness, they
realize his instruments were destroyed by the same power outage that killed the electricity at the community
store, where Englischers are stranded with dead cell phones and cars that won't start.

Moses offers a sobering theory, but no one can know how drastically life is about to change. With the only
self-sustaining food supply in the region, the Pacifist community is forced to forge an alliance with the
handful of stranded Englischers in an effort to protect not only the food but their very lives.

In the weeks that follow, Leora, Moses, and the community will be tested as never before, requiring them to
make decisions they never thought possible. Whom will they help and whom will they turn away? When the
community receives news of a new threat, everyone must decide how far they're willing to go to protect their
beliefs and way of life.
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From reader reviews:

Allen Goehring:

This The Alliance book is simply not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The
benefit you receive by reading this book is actually information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will
get information which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This particular
The Alliance without we understand teach the one who looking at it become critical in pondering and
analyzing. Don't possibly be worry The Alliance can bring if you are and not make your case space or
bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even cellphone. This The
Alliance having great arrangement in word and layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Francisco Morgan:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be revise about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make them keep up with the era that is always change and make progress. Some of you maybe will update
themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming to a
person is you don't know what kind you should start with. This The Alliance is our recommendation to cause
you to keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Jacqueline Britt:

This The Alliance is great publication for you because the content that is certainly full of information for you
who else always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it details
accurately using great coordinate word or we can claim no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read the
item hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward
sentences but hard core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having The Alliance in your hand like
keeping the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no e-book that offer you
world within ten or fifteen minute right but this book already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book.
Hey Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt in which?

Shantel McCary:

Beside this The Alliance in your phone, it might give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or data.
The information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh in the oven so don't always be worry if you
feel like an aged people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have The Alliance because this book
offers to you readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you don't get what it's facts
concerning. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable blend here
cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss that? Find this
book and read it from currently!
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