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Wylie Dalton didn’t believe in fairy tales or love at first sight.

Then she met a real-life Peter Pan.

When Wylie encounters Phinn—confident, mature, and devastatingly handsome—at a party the night before
her brother goes to juvie, she can’t believe how fast she falls for him. And that’s before he shows her how to
fly.

Soon Wylie and her brothers find themselves whisked away to a mysterious tropical island off the coast of
New York City where nobody ages beyond seventeen and life is a constant party. Wylie’s in heaven: now
her brother won’t go to jail and she can escape her over-scheduled life with all its woes and
responsibilities—permanently.

But the deeper Wylie falls for Phinn, the more she begins to discover has been kept from her and her
brothers. Somebody on the island has been lying to her, but the truth can’t stay hidden forever.
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From reader reviews:

John Reed:

Do you one among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on
guys this specific aren't like that. This Never Ever book is readable simply by you who hate the straight word
style. You will find the information here are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without
leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer involving Never Ever content
conveys objective easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
content material but it just different such as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Never Ever is not loveable to
be your top listing reading book?

Steven Connell:

This Never Ever are reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person, why. The key reason
why of this Never Ever can be one of the great books you must have is definitely giving you more than just
simple studying food but feed anyone with information that might be will shock your before knowledge. This
book is actually handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever your conditions at e-book and
printed ones. Beside that this Never Ever giving you an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary,
giving you test of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and
luxuriate in reading.

Salvador Swain:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Never Ever, it is possible to
enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh
can happen its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Rosario Jones:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this Never Ever guide written by well-known
writer whose to say well how to make book that may be understand by anyone who have read the book.
Written within good manner for you, leaking every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own
personal hunger then you still hesitation Never Ever as good book but not only by the cover but also by
content. This is one e-book that can break don't evaluate book by its deal with, so do you still needing an
additional sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already said so why you have to
listening to an additional sixth sense.
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