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Jenna and Ryder are far from friends—until a storm stirs up their passion in this contemporary southern
romance from New York Times bestselling author Kristi Cook.

In Magnolia Branch, Mississippi, The Cafferty and Marsden families are practically royalty. Neighbors since
the Civil War, the families have shared vacations, holidays, backyard barbecues, and the overwhelming
desire to unite their two clans by marriage. So when the families finally have a baby boy and girl at the same
time, the perfect opportunity seems to have arrived.

Except Jemma Cafferty and Ryder Marsden have no intention of giving in to their parents’ wishes. They’re
only seventeen—oh, and also? They hate each other. Jemma can’t stand Ryder’s nauseating golden-boy
persona, and Ryder would prefer it if stubborn-headed Jemma didn’t exist. And their communication is not
exactly effective: even a casual hello turns into a yelling match.

But when a violent Mississippi storm ravages through Magnolia Branch, it unearths feelings Jemma and
Ryder didn’t know they had. And the line between love and hate just might be thin enough to cross…
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From reader reviews:

Rosemarie Cleveland:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be revise about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era that is certainly always change and make progress.
Some of you maybe can update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice in your case but the
problems coming to a person is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Magnolia is our
recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and want in this
era.

Daniel Engle:

The publication with title Magnolia has lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of
advantage after read this book. This specific book exist new expertise the information that exist in this e-
book represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to learn how the
improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you in new era of the globalization. You can read the
e-book on your smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Charles Massie:

Why? Because this Magnolia is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap this
but latter it will shock you with the secret this inside. Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who
else write the book in such wonderful way makes the content interior easier to understand, entertaining
method but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this ever
again or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you a lot of rewards than the other book have
such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hesitate having
that book? If I were you I will go to the e-book store hurriedly.

William Moreau:

Beside this kind of Magnolia in your phone, it can give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or
info. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh in the oven so don't be worry if
you feel like an outdated people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Magnolia because this
book offers to you readable information. Do you often have book but you rarely get what it's facts
concerning. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot
be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss this? Find this book
and also read it from currently!
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