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The importance of imaginary friends is very real in this picture book adventure from the author of Say Hello
to Zorro! and lead character designer for Despicable Me, Finding Nemo, and Monsters, Inc.

Phillip and Brock are best friends. Everyone can see Phillip, but only Phillip can see Brock.

A night at the Big Fair is all fun and games until Phillip gets sleepy, heads home, and forgets Brock!

Brock misses Phillip. And Phillip misses Brock. Will they reunite? With the help of another pair of pals, they
just might. Because even imaginary friends get lost sometimes. Finding them is part of the adventure.
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From reader reviews:

Elizabeth Wiggins:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your problem; you can
add your knowledge by the e-book entitled We Forgot Brock!. Try to face the book We Forgot Brock! as
your good friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you really feel alone and beside associated
with course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you a lot
more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let us make new experience and
knowledge with this book.

Scottie Hicks:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they are still students or the idea for all people
in the world, the particular best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every
person has distinct personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't need do that. You must know how great as well as important the book We Forgot Brock!. All type of
book could you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Laura Burnham:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside using friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can really hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It alright
you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like We Forgot Brock! which is
finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.

Gloria Quinones:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got pupils? We believe that that problem was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. So you know
that little person similar to reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to know that reading
is very important and book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update in relation to something by book. A
substantial number of sorts of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is We Forgot Brock!.
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