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An introduction to the concepts and principles of architectural structures in an easy-to-read format

Written as an easy-to-understand primer on the topic, Structure for Architects engages readers through
instruction that uses a highly visual format and real-world examples to underline the key facets of structural
principles that are essential to the design process. Eschewing complicated mathematics and technical jargon,
Structure for Architects demystifies the subject matter by showing it in the context of everyday situations,
giving architects and architectural technologists a clear understanding of how to incorporate structural
principles into their designs.

Highlights of this book include:

A rich collection of drawings, photographs, and diagrams, spread throughout the text, which demonstrate●

fundamental structural concepts using everyday examples
An overview of structural design basics, as well as a summary of structural forms●

A look at the design implications of steel, reinforced concrete, and wood●

By providing an overall view of structures that covers the essentials of what architects and architectural
technologists need to know, Structure for Architects is a valuable tool for illustrating the importance of
designing with structure in mind and for learning the basics that are necessary for collaborating confidently
with project team members.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Marburger:

Book is usually written, printed, or created for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important factor to bring us around the world. Beside
that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A guide Structure for Architects: A Primer will make you
to become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you
think that will open or reading the book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they might be thought
like that? Have you trying to find best book or appropriate book with you?

John King:

The book Structure for Architects: A Primer can give more knowledge and information about everything you
want. Why must we leave the great thing like a book Structure for Architects: A Primer? A number of you
have a different opinion about guide. But one aim that book can give many information for us. It is
absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or information that you take for that,
you may give for each other; you could share all of these. Book Structure for Architects: A Primer has
simple shape however, you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can appearance the
enormous world by open and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Salvador Swain:

You will get this Structure for Architects: A Primer by visit the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or
reviewing it could to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this guide are
various. Not only by simply written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In
the modern era like now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what your problem.
Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your publication. It is most important to arrange
you to ultimately make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.

Brandon Francis:

E-book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
native or citizen require book to know the revise information of year to be able to year. As we know those
ebooks have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world. By
book Structure for Architects: A Primer we can have more advantage. Don't that you be creative people?
Being creative person must love to read a book. Just choose the best book that acceptable with your aim.
Don't end up being doubt to change your life with that book Structure for Architects: A Primer. You can
more inviting than now.
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