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The gripping new novel featuring unorthodox Edinburgh lawyer Brodie McClennan, who must investigate a
ritualistic murder in the Highlands in order to clear her name.

A woman is lured to a lonely ruin in the Scottish Highlands and strangled almost to the point of death. As
she prays for mercy, her hopes are shattered when her unseen assailant begins to carve her face, and she is
left alone to bleed her life's blood into a shallow grave.

In Edinburgh, 29–year–old lawyer Brodie McLennan is coming to terms with the discovery of the family she
never knew she had. She must also fight the increasing resentment of the Edinburgh Bar. As the complaints
to the Law Society about Brodie pile up, her grandfather and legal legend Lord MacGregor fears that Brodie
is in danger and advises that to protect her reputation, she should become a crown prosecutor-accept
'silk'–something that rankles with Brodie's natural inclination to protect the underdog. When Lord
McGregor's prophecy is fulfilled and Brodie is implicated in the disappearance of a fellow lawyer, she
realises he is right–she is now a marked woman.

Then the missing woman is found in a remote mental hospital, the walls of her cell smeared in blood, the
name 'Brodie' written over and over…

Back in Edinburgh, a knife is found with Brodie's fingerprints. It seems that someone is out to stop Brodie's
rise to the top–at any cost…
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From reader reviews:

Lavelle Hildreth:

Blood Lines can be one of your basic books that are good idea. We all recommend that straight away
because this guide has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit
entertaining but delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to put every word into
delight arrangement in writing Blood Lines yet doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest in
addition to based confirm resource info that maybe you can be one among it. This great information can
easily drawn you into brand new stage of crucial imagining.

Chad Brown:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book than can satisfy
your small amount of time to read it because this time you only find guide that need more time to be read.
Blood Lines can be your answer since it can be read by an individual who have those short free time
problems.

Tina Alley:

Many people spending their time by playing outside using friends, fun activity with family or just watching
TV the entire day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading through a book. Ugh, do
you think reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Blood Lines which is getting the e-
book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.

Kathleen Carroll:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen require book to know the upgrade information of year to year. As we know
those books have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world.
By book Blood Lines we can get more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To be creative person
must want to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't always be
doubt to change your life at this book Blood Lines. You can more desirable than now.
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